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The church in our time easily loses sight of her mission to witness to the resurrected Christ. Studying Acts
identifies us with the early church and the way the gospel shaped her as she began witnessing in Judea and
continuing, in concentric circles, "to the end of the earth." Acts reminds us that the story of the church
remains incomplete—that there continues to this day an "Acts 29."

We face relentless opposition as our postmodern world mirrors the world of the apostles. Planting and
growing churches in such an environment poses particular challenges. Nevertheless, Acts clearly
demonstrates that no obstacle can withstand the power of the Holy Spirit. As he did in the early church, the
Holy Spirit teaches us in Acts to "expect great things."

As are all the books in the Reformed Expository Commentary series, this exposition of Acts is accessible to
both pastors and lay readers. Each volume in the series provides exposition that gives careful attention to the
biblical text, is doctrinally Reformed, focuses on Christ through the lens of redemptive history, and applies
the Bible to our contemporary setting.
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From reader reviews:

Frederick Roark:

Within other case, little folks like to read book Acts (Reformed Expository Commentary). You can choose
the best book if you like reading a book. Given that we know about how is important a book Acts (Reformed
Expository Commentary). You can add information and of course you can around the world by way of a
book. Absolutely right, mainly because from book you can understand everything! From your country right
up until foreign or abroad you will end up known. About simple matter until wonderful thing you may know
that. In this era, you can open a book as well as searching by internet gadget. It is called e-book. You may
use it when you feel weary to go to the library. Let's read.

Jason Harden:

Book is written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a e-book.
Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important issue to bring us around the world.
Beside that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A reserve Acts (Reformed Expository
Commentary) will make you to always be smarter. You can feel considerably more confidence if you can
know about almost everything. But some of you think in which open or reading any book make you bored. It
isn't make you fun. Why they may be thought like that? Have you looking for best book or acceptable book
with you?

Edna Barnett:

The feeling that you get from Acts (Reformed Expository Commentary) is a more deep you excavating the
information that hide inside words the more you get enthusiastic about reading it. It doesn't mean that this
book is hard to be aware of but Acts (Reformed Expository Commentary) giving you buzz feeling of
reading. The article writer conveys their point in selected way that can be understood simply by anyone who
read the idea because the author of this e-book is well-known enough. This book also makes your own
vocabulary increase well. Therefore it is easy to understand then can go along with you, both in printed or e-
book style are available. We advise you for having that Acts (Reformed Expository Commentary) instantly.

Daphne Jones:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind talent
or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book when
compared with can satisfy your short period of time to read it because this all time you only find guide that
need more time to be go through. Acts (Reformed Expository Commentary) can be your answer given it can
be read by a person who have those short time problems.
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