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Jess Mastriani -- dubbed "Lightning Girl" by the press when, after a huge storm, she developed a psychic
ability to find missing children -- has lost her miraculous powers. Or has she? She would like the media and
the government to think so. All Jess wants is to be left alone, by everyone except sexy Rob Wilkins -- who
still hasn't called, by the way....

But it doesn't look like Jess is going to get her wish -- especially not while she's stuck working at a summer
camp for musically gifted kids. Then the father of a missing girl shows up to beg Jess to find his daughter.
Jess can't say no, but now the feds are on her trail again, as is one ornery stepdad, who'd like to see Lightning
Girl...well, dead.
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From reader reviews:

Juanita Hernandez:

Do you have favorite book? For those who have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important
thing for us to learn everything in the world. Each guide has different aim or maybe goal; it means that book
has different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their time to read a book. They are reading
whatever they have because their hobby is usually reading a book. Why not the person who don't like
looking at a book? Sometime, particular person feel need book whenever they found difficult problem as
well as exercise. Well, probably you will want this Code Name Cassandra (1-800-Where-R-You).

Kevin Roark:

The book Code Name Cassandra (1-800-Where-R-You) will bring one to the new experience of reading the
book. The author style to explain the idea is very unique. When you try to find new book to study, this book
very ideal to you. The book Code Name Cassandra (1-800-Where-R-You) is much recommended to you to
read. You can also get the e-book in the official web site, so you can quicker to read the book.

Michael Crew:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside using friends, fun activity with family or just
watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by looking at a book. Ugh,
do you consider reading a book really can hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It fine you
can have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like Code Name Cassandra (1-
800-Where-R-You) which is having the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's find.

Thelma Cobb:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you can have it in e-book
way, more simple and reachable. This particular Code Name Cassandra (1-800-Where-R-You) can give you
a lot of close friends because by you considering this one book you have matter that they don't and make an
individual more like an interesting person. This specific book can be one of a step for you to get success.
This publication offer you information that probably your friend doesn't understand, by knowing more than
different make you to be great people. So , why hesitate? Let me have Code Name Cassandra (1-800-Where-
R-You).
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