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Luther’s Works: The American Edition, published by Concordia and Fortress Press between 1955 and 1986,
comprises fifty-five volumes. These are a selection representing only about a third of Luther’s works in the
Latin and German of the standard Weimar Edition, not including the German Bible. When Luther was
prevailed upon to write a preface to the projected complete edition of his Latin writings in 1545, about a year
before his death, he took the opportunity to review the high points of his career—to show that he really never
had the time and talent to produce literature worth preserving, that in publishing these works he was now
merely yielding to his friends' argument that his works would be published in any case, if not with his
cooperation, then possibly by men who had no real understanding of them. That was one thing. But in that
preface Luther also implored the reader of his Latin writings "for the sake of our Lord Jesus Christ Himself
to read those things judiciously, yes, with great commiseration". With Luther's lectures on the Epistle to the
Romans he had a splendid opportunity to share with his students the great find of his life, "that place in Paul
which was for me truly the gate of Paradise."
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From reader reviews:

Rose Nguyen:

Do you have favorite book? For those who have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important
thing for us to find out everything in the world. Each book has different aim or perhaps goal; it means that
publication has different type. Some people really feel enjoy to spend their time for you to read a book. They
may be reading whatever they consider because their hobby is usually reading a book. How about the person
who don't like examining a book? Sometime, person feel need book whenever they found difficult problem
or exercise. Well, probably you'll have this Luther's Works, Vol. 25: Lectures on Romans.

Kathryn Bowen:

Information is provisions for those to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone with
everywhere. The information can be a understanding or any news even restricted. What people must be
consider when those information which is inside former life are challenging to be find than now could be
taking seriously which one would work to believe or which one typically the resource are convinced. If you
get the unstable resource then you understand it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for
you. All those possibilities will not happen in you if you take Luther's Works, Vol. 25: Lectures on Romans
as your daily resource information.

Kathy Graves:

Would you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt when you are in the book store? Try to
pick one book that you find out the inside because don't assess book by its cover may doesn't work the
following is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in the outside
seem likes. Maybe you answer might be Luther's Works, Vol. 25: Lectures on Romans why because the
excellent cover that make you consider with regards to the content will not disappoint you actually. The
inside or content is fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly assist you
to pick up this book.

Jonathan Bean:

You can find this Luther's Works, Vol. 25: Lectures on Romans by browse the bookstore or Mall. Simply
viewing or reviewing it might to be your solve difficulty if you get difficulties for ones knowledge. Kinds of
this reserve are various. Not only by written or printed but can you enjoy this book by means of e-book. In
the modern era just like now, you just looking of your mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right
now, choose your ways to get more information about your reserve. It is most important to arrange yourself
to make your knowledge are still revise. Let's try to choose appropriate ways for you.
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