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Fundamentals of biochemistry and molecular biology is an important component of all disciplines of
Biology. In the era of multidisciplinary approach, the basic techniques in Biochemistry and Molecular
Biology are much needed by the students of Botany, Zoology, Microbiology, Biotechnology, Fisheries,
Veterinary, Pharmacology, Physiology, Medicine, Genetics, Agriculture and allied subjects both at
undergraduate and postgraduate levels. This book includes 15 chapters covering more than 135 experimental
protocols. It discussed all the relevant topics like pH and buffers, spectrophotometry, chromatography,
carbohydrates, lipids, proteins, electrophoresis, enzyme immunology, vitamins and pigments, metabolites
and molecular biology. It includes a wide range of experiments from preparation of culture media to PCR,
Southern and Western blotting. All the experiments have been meticulously designed and special care has
been taken to the safety in laboratory and precautions are given wheresoever required.
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From reader reviews:

Kelley Thornton:

The particular book Basic Techniques in Biochemistry and Molecular Biology will bring someone to the new
experience of reading any book. The author style to explain the idea is very unique. When you try to find
new book to see, this book very suitable to you. The book Basic Techniques in Biochemistry and Molecular
Biology is much recommended to you to study. You can also get the e-book in the official web site, so you
can easier to read the book.

Teresa Hunter:

Can you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Try to pick
one book that you never know the inside because don't evaluate book by its cover may doesn't work this is
difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not because fantastic as in the outside appearance
likes. Maybe you answer can be Basic Techniques in Biochemistry and Molecular Biology why because the
excellent cover that make you consider regarding the content will not disappoint anyone. The inside or
content is usually fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly show you to
pick up this book.

Josette Leonard:

This Basic Techniques in Biochemistry and Molecular Biology is great publication for you because the
content that is certainly full of information for you who all always deal with world and get to make decision
every minute. This particular book reveal it information accurately using great organize word or we can state
no rambling sentences inside. So if you are read it hurriedly you can have whole facts in it. Doesn't mean it
only provides you with straight forward sentences but tricky core information with wonderful delivering
sentences. Having Basic Techniques in Biochemistry and Molecular Biology in your hand like keeping the
world in your arm, data in it is not ridiculous one. We can say that no e-book that offer you world inside ten
or fifteen small right but this reserve already do that. So , it is good reading book. Hey there Mr. and Mrs.
busy do you still doubt this?

April Harry:

Do you like reading a reserve? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book has been rare? Why
so many concern for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some people likes
looking at, not only science book but novel and Basic Techniques in Biochemistry and Molecular Biology or
even others sources were given information for you. After you know how the truly amazing a book, you feel
need to read more and more. Science e-book was created for teacher as well as students especially. Those
guides are helping them to add their knowledge. In different case, beside science guide, any other book likes
Basic Techniques in Biochemistry and Molecular Biology to make your spare time much more colorful.
Many types of book like this one.
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