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A Comprehensive, Proven Approach to IT Scalability from Two Veteran Software, Technology, and
Business Executives
 
In  The Art of Scalability,  AKF Partners cofounders Martin L. Abbott and Michael T. Fisher cover
everything IT and business leaders must know to build technology infrastructures that can scale smoothly to
meet any business requirement. Drawing on their unparalleled experience managing some of the world’s
highest-transaction-volume Web sites, the authors provide detailed models and best-practice approaches
available in no other book.
 
Unlike previous books on scalability,  The Art of Scalability  doesn’t limit its coverage to technology.
Writing for both technical and nontechnical decision-makers, this book covers everything that impacts
scalability, including architecture, processes, people, and organizations.
 
Throughout, the authors address a broad spectrum of real-world challenges, from performance testing to IT
governance. Using their tools and guidance, organizations can systematically overcome obstacles to
scalability and achieve unprecedented levels of technical and business performance.
 
Coverage includes

Staffing the scalable organization: essential organizational, management, and leadership skills for technical●

leaders
Building processes for scale: process lessons from hyper-growth companies, from technical issue●

resolution to crisis management
Making better “build versus buy” decisions●

Architecting scalable solutions: powerful proprietary models for identifying scalability needs and choosing●

the best approaches to meet them
Optimizing performance through caching, application and database splitting, and asynchronous design●

Scalability techniques for emerging technologies, including clouds and grids●

Planning for rapid data growth and new data centers●

Evolving monitoring strategies to tightly align with customer requirements●
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From reader reviews:

Lauren Graves:

The book The Art of Scalability: Scalable Web Architecture, Processes, and Organizations for the Modern
Enterprise can give more knowledge and information about everything you want. Why then must we leave a
good thing like a book The Art of Scalability: Scalable Web Architecture, Processes, and Organizations for
the Modern Enterprise? Wide variety you have a different opinion about reserve. But one aim in which book
can give many info for us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right now, try to closer along with your book.
Knowledge or information that you take for that, it is possible to give for each other; you are able to share all
of these. Book The Art of Scalability: Scalable Web Architecture, Processes, and Organizations for the
Modern Enterprise has simple shape however, you know: it has great and big function for you. You can
appear the enormous world by available and read a guide. So it is very wonderful.

Michelle Seidl:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them friends and
family or their friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just watching TV,
or even playing video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity that is look different you
can read a new book. It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent the
entire day to reading a book. The book The Art of Scalability: Scalable Web Architecture, Processes, and
Organizations for the Modern Enterprise it is very good to read. There are a lot of individuals who
recommended this book. They were enjoying reading this book. In the event you did not have enough space
to develop this book you can buy the e-book. You can m0ore quickly to read this book from the smart phone.
The price is not too costly but this book possesses high quality.

Kathy Donnelly:

Would you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Try to
pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't judge book by its include may doesn't work is
difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in the outside look likes.
Maybe you answer might be The Art of Scalability: Scalable Web Architecture, Processes, and
Organizations for the Modern Enterprise why because the excellent cover that make you consider about the
content will not disappoint you actually. The inside or content is definitely fantastic as the outside as well as
cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly assist you to pick up this book.

Jacqueline Britt:

Beside this The Art of Scalability: Scalable Web Architecture, Processes, and Organizations for the Modern
Enterprise in your phone, it could give you a way to get nearer to the new knowledge or facts. The
information and the knowledge you might got here is fresh from the oven so don't become worry if you feel
like an previous people live in narrow town. It is good thing to have The Art of Scalability: Scalable Web



Architecture, Processes, and Organizations for the Modern Enterprise because this book offers to your
account readable information. Do you often have book but you do not get what it's interesting features of. Oh
come on, that will not end up to happen if you have this in your hand. The Enjoyable agreement here cannot
be questionable, including treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to miss this? Find this book in
addition to read it from at this point!
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