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The Borgias were the most infamous family in Renaissance Italy, and their legend principally revolves
around three individuals: Pope Alexander VI, his daughter Lucrezia and her brother Cesare. Thanks to the
alleged actions of these three, their family name has become synonymous with a lust for power, corruption,
greed, sexual depravity and murder.

The lives of Alexander, Lucrezia and Cesare make for a great story, and there have been numerous novels,
plays, films and television dramas devoted to them. Unfortunately, the demands of popular entertainment do
not necessarily make for accurate history.

Whether the renaissance clan were truly as evil as they have traditionally been portrayed is open to question.
Much of the Black Legend, which surrounds them comes from rival families who were equally as hungry for
power and position, as were the Borgias. In truth, the Borgias were despised in Rome not just for their
success, but because their family roots were in Valencia, in the north-east of Spain.

Certainly, some of the charges levelled against the family were correct. Alexander was greedy and corrupt
and wished to create a legacy for his family. Without a doubt, he used unsavoury means to acquire the papal
tiara but he was also a genuinely devout man who wished to modernise the Catholic Church and was a skilful
and astute diplomat. He did have several mistresses and at least eight children, but so did many other popes
of the era.

Lucrezia has been portrayed as a scheming whore who indulged in murder and incest. She did marry three
times and gave birth to eight children, possibly more. However, much of the propaganda about her was
circulated by Giovanni Sforza, her first husband, who had been cuckolded by his young wife.

Finally, there was Cesare, who acquired a reputation as a military leader, but also for ruthlessness in the
acquisition and maintenance of political power. In addition, the Black Legend contains accounts of Cesare’s
licentious lifestyle, him murdering enemies and opponents and his alleged sexual relationship with his sister.

Whatever the truth, there is much to cover in the lives of these three individuals.
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From reader reviews:

Phyllis Kelly:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? Yep, you can
choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to take a stroll,
shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open as well as read a book called The Borgias: Three
Faces of Evil? Maybe it is to become best activity for you. You already know beside you can spend your
time along with your favorite's book, you can more intelligent than before. Do you agree with it is opinion or
you have additional opinion?

Michelle Chase:

Now a day people who Living in the era everywhere everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources within it can be true or not call for people to be aware of each info they get. How individuals to be
smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book. Reading through a
book can help individuals out of this uncertainty Information mainly this The Borgias: Three Faces of Evil
book since this book offers you rich information and knowledge. Of course the knowledge in this book
hundred per cent guarantees there is no doubt in it you know.

Sherrill Height:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the free time or they will
get wide range of stress from both lifestyle and work. So , once we ask do people have free time, we will say
absolutely of course. People is human not just a robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity do you
possess when the spare time coming to a person of course your answer may unlimited right. Then ever try
this one, reading publications. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time, the particular
book you have read is definitely The Borgias: Three Faces of Evil.

Antonio Fells:

A number of people said that they feel bored when they reading a reserve. They are directly felt that when
they get a half portions of the book. You can choose typically the book The Borgias: Three Faces of Evil to
make your personal reading is interesting. Your current skill of reading talent is developing when you similar
to reading. Try to choose very simple book to make you enjoy to study it and mingle the sensation about
book and reading through especially. It is to be initial opinion for you to like to available a book and go
through it. Beside that the publication The Borgias: Three Faces of Evil can to be a newly purchased friend
when you're really feel alone and confuse with what must you're doing of that time.
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