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Dr. Penny Sartori is a registered nurse who began researching Near Death Experiences (NDEs) in 1995 after
one of her long-term intensive care patients begged her to let him die in peace. The event shook her deeply
and eventually led her to enroll in a PhD program to research NDEs. The findings, along with the profound
spiritual lessons that she has gleaned from her work, are published here.
 
During her academic work, Dr. Sartori studied three samples of ICU patients during a five year period. The
first consisted of 243 patients from the first year of data collection who survived their ICU experience. Of
those, two experienced an NDE, and two an out-of-body experience (OBE). The second cohort consisted of
survivors of cardiac arrest during the five year period. Of those, 39 patients (or 18%) experienced an NDE.
The third cohort consisted of all the patients who experienced an NDE during the five year period. Their
stories are captured in her new book.
 
One patient in particular, patient number 10, stands out for Dr. Sartori. “He was in bad condition,” she says.
“When we put him into bed he was unconscious and unresponsive. Later he reported an OBE. He was
accurately able to tell us which doctor was in the room and what he had said while he was unconscious. He
claimed to have met his deceased father and a Jesus-like figure. But the most extraordinary part was that
afterwards he was able to use his hand, which had been paralyzed since birth. There is no medical
explanation for how that healing occurred.”
 
When asked about the biggest takeaway from her research, Dr. Sartori says, “In medicine, we’re trained to
believe that the brain gives rise to consciousness. My research into NDEs has made me question this
prevailing paradigm, which admittedly is very widespread. The most important lesson for me has been a
deeper appreciation for death and a whole lot less fear and anxiety about it.”
 
In addition to detailing dozens of case studies, the book also discusses childhood NDEs, differences in NDEs
among different cultures, and the after-effects of NDEs--one of which is the inability, in some patients, to
wear a wrist-watch.
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From reader reviews:

Shirley Raine:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have far more or little spare time? Yeah, you
can choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to take a move,
shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open or perhaps read a book eligible Wisdom of Near
Death Experiences: How Understanding NDEs Can Help Us Live More Fully? Maybe it is being best
activity for you. You already know beside you can spend your time using your favorite's book, you can wiser
than before. Do you agree with it is opinion or you have different opinion?

Theresa Adams:

Do you have something that that suits you such as book? The book lovers usually prefer to opt for book like
comic, small story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not seeking Wisdom of Near Death
Experiences: How Understanding NDEs Can Help Us Live More Fully that give your enjoyment preference
will be satisfied through reading this book. Reading routine all over the world can be said as the opportunity
for people to know world a great deal better then how they react when it comes to the world. It can't be
explained constantly that reading practice only for the geeky individual but for all of you who wants to end
up being success person. So , for all of you who want to start reading through as your good habit, you can
pick Wisdom of Near Death Experiences: How Understanding NDEs Can Help Us Live More Fully become
your own personal starter.

Morris Sampson:

Would you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt when you find yourself in the book
store? Try and pick one book that you never know the inside because don't evaluate book by its include may
doesn't work the following is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not seeing that
fantastic as in the outside seem likes. Maybe you answer may be Wisdom of Near Death Experiences: How
Understanding NDEs Can Help Us Live More Fully why because the fantastic cover that make you consider
in regards to the content will not disappoint you actually. The inside or content is actually fantastic as the
outside or cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly assist you to pick up this book.

Carl Johnson:

A lot of reserve has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by web on social media. You can
choose the most effective book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it.
It is called of book Wisdom of Near Death Experiences: How Understanding NDEs Can Help Us Live More
Fully. You can contribute your knowledge by it. Without causing the printed book, it might add your
knowledge and make an individual happier to read. It is most important that, you must aware about guide. It
can bring you from one destination for a other place.
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