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Keisha Ceylon is a psychic. At least, that's what she tells people. She watches the news for stories of missing
people, then waits a few days and goes to see the family. She tells them she’s had a vision and that she may
know where their missing loved one is—for a price, of course.

Keisha's latest mark is Wendell Garfield, whose wife disappeared a week ago. She's seen him on TV,
pleading for his wife to come home, or for whoever took her to let her go. Keisha tells Wendell her vision of
what might have happened. Unluckily for Keisha, her vision turns out to be alarmingly close to the truth. As
she wades deeper into the mystery, Keisha inadvertently finds herself caught in a web of suspicion and
violence that’s much more complicated than she first thought—and which may end up with her own
disappearance…

Also includes a preview of Linwood Barclay’s newest thriller, Trust Your Eyes
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From reader reviews:

Cari Sexton:

This book untitled Never Saw It Coming: (An eSpecial from New American Library) to be one of several
books in which best seller in this year, here is because when you read this reserve you can get a lot of benefit
upon it. You will easily to buy this book in the book retailer or you can order it by way of online. The
publisher with this book sells the e-book too. It makes you easier to read this book, since you can read this
book in your Mobile phone. So there is no reason to you to past this reserve from your list.

Donnie Matthews:

Reading a publication can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world really likes. Do you like
reading book consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a reserve will give
you a lot of new details. When you read a book you will get new information since book is one of many
ways to share the information or even their idea. Second, reading a book will make you actually more
imaginative. When you examining a book especially fictional book the author will bring that you imagine the
story how the people do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to others. When you read
this Never Saw It Coming: (An eSpecial from New American Library), you are able to tells your family,
friends and also soon about yours publication. Your knowledge can inspire the others, make them reading a
reserve.

Helen Tate:

Reading a e-book tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With reading you can get a lot of
information that may give you benefit in your life. Having book everyone in this world could share their
idea. Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire their reader with their story or
maybe their experience. Not only situation that share in the textbooks. But also they write about the
information about something that you need example. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
kids, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors in this world always try to improve their
talent in writing, they also doing some research before they write to the book. One of them is this Never Saw
It Coming: (An eSpecial from New American Library).

Elizabeth Daugherty:

Can you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt when you are in the book store? Make an
effort to pick one book that you never know the inside because don't evaluate book by its cover may doesn't
work the following is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in
the outside appear likes. Maybe you answer may be Never Saw It Coming: (An eSpecial from New
American Library) why because the amazing cover that make you consider with regards to the content will
not disappoint you actually. The inside or content is definitely fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your
reading 6th sense will directly direct you to pick up this book.
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