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For more than four decades, the Kips Bay Decorator Show House has presented the creations of a stellar
roster of interior designers in what is regarded as one of the finest decorator show houses in the world. A
fixture on the New York City scene, this glittering expression of high design continues to set the standard for
the world of decor. Forty Years of Fabulous provides an insider’s look at the history of this much-loved
convention of society while revisiting the spectacular rooms by star decorators past and present?rooms that
truly defined interior design while setting trends still evident in today’s homes.

Steven Stolman is the author of Scalamandré: Haute Décor. He divides his time among homes in Palm
Beach, New York and Milwaukee.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Vu:

Book is written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can learn everything you want by a book. Book
has a different type. We all know that that book is important matter to bring us around the world. Next to that
you can your reading expertise was fluently. A publication 40 Years of Fabulous: The Kips Bay Decorator
Show House will make you to always be smarter. You can feel much more confidence if you can know about
almost everything. But some of you think which open or reading some sort of book make you bored. It is not
necessarily make you fun. Why they are often thought like that? Have you trying to find best book or
acceptable book with you?

Margarita Toman:

This 40 Years of Fabulous: The Kips Bay Decorator Show House book is not really ordinary book, you have
it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you have by reading this book is definitely information inside
this book incredible fresh, you will get information which is getting deeper an individual read a lot of
information you will get. This kind of 40 Years of Fabulous: The Kips Bay Decorator Show House without
we know teach the one who looking at it become critical in imagining and analyzing. Don't always be worry
40 Years of Fabulous: The Kips Bay Decorator Show House can bring when you are and not make your case
space or bookshelves' turn out to be full because you can have it inside your lovely laptop even mobile
phone. This 40 Years of Fabulous: The Kips Bay Decorator Show House having good arrangement in word
as well as layout, so you will not truly feel uninterested in reading.

Joyce Shryock:

People live in this new day of lifestyle always try to and must have the time or they will get great deal of
stress from both daily life and work. So , once we ask do people have spare time, we will say absolutely yes.
People is human not only a robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity are you experiencing when
the spare time coming to you of course your answer will certainly unlimited right. Then do you ever try this
one, reading textbooks. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, the particular book you have
read will be 40 Years of Fabulous: The Kips Bay Decorator Show House.

John Parish:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information
from a book. Book is written or printed or created from each source in which filled update of news. With this
modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From media social like
newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic. You can add your
understanding by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just looking for
the 40 Years of Fabulous: The Kips Bay Decorator Show House when you required it?
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