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Robert E. Howard is famous for creating such immortal heroes as Conan the Cimmerian, Solomon Kane, and
Bran Mak Morn. Less well-known but equally extraordinary are his non-fantasy adventure stories set in the
Middle East and featuring such two-fisted heroes as Francis Xavier Gordon—known as “El Borak”—Kirby
O’Donnell, and Steve Clarney. This trio of hard-fighting Americans, civilized men with more than a touch of
the primordial in their veins, marked a new direction for Howard’s writing, and new territory for his genius
to conquer.

The wily Texan El Borak, a hardened fighter who stalks the sandscapes of Afghanistan like a vengeful wolf,
is rivaled among Howard’s creations only by Conan himself. In such classic tales as “The Daughter of Erlik
Khan,” “Three-Bladed Doom,” and “Sons of the Hawk,” Howard proves himself once again a master of
action, and with plenty of eerie atmosphere his plotting becomes tighter and twistier than ever, resulting in
stories worthy of comparison to Jack London and Rudyard Kipling. Every fan of Robert E. Howard and
aficionados of great adventure writing will want to own this collection of the best of Howard’s desert tales,
lavishly illustrated by award-winning artists Tim Bradstreet and Jim & Ruth Keegan.
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From reader reviews:

Gavin Wilkins:

Inside other case, little men and women like to read book El Borak and Other Desert Adventures. You can
choose the best book if you want reading a book. So long as we know about how is important a new book El
Borak and Other Desert Adventures. You can add understanding and of course you can around the world by
just a book. Absolutely right, because from book you can recognize everything! From your country until
finally foreign or abroad you will find yourself known. About simple thing until wonderful thing you could
know that. In this era, we can open a book or perhaps searching by internet gadget. It is called e-book. You
need to use it when you feel uninterested to go to the library. Let's read.

Ramon Jeter:

The guide with title El Borak and Other Desert Adventures posesses a lot of information that you can
discover it. You can get a lot of gain after read this book. This specific book exist new know-how the
information that exist in this reserve represented the condition of the world at this point. That is important to
yo7u to be aware of how the improvement of the world. That book will bring you within new era of the
glowbal growth. You can read the e-book on your own smart phone, so you can read that anywhere you
want.

Wendy Hartnett:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you can have it in
e-book means, more simple and reachable. This kind of El Borak and Other Desert Adventures can give you
a lot of close friends because by you checking out this one book you have issue that they don't and make a
person more like an interesting person. This book can be one of one step for you to get success. This e-book
offer you information that maybe your friend doesn't know, by knowing more than different make you to be
great folks. So , why hesitate? We need to have El Borak and Other Desert Adventures.

Mark York:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got scholars? We believe that that problem was
given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. Therefore you
know that little person like reading or as studying become their hobby. You need to understand that reading
is very important along with book as to be the factor. Book is important thing to include you knowledge,
except your own teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update regarding something by book. Many kinds
of books that can you go onto be your object. One of them are these claims El Borak and Other Desert
Adventures.
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