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A reissue of E. E. Cummings's long-unavailable, yet pointed and moving story of a journey through
Soviet Russia.

Unavailable for more than fifty years, EIMI finally returns. While sometimes termed a "novel," it is better
described as a novelistic travelogue, the diary of a trip to Russia in the 1930s during the rise of the Stalinist
government. Despite some contempt for what he witnesses, Cummings's narrator has an effective,
occasionally hilarious way of evoking feelings of accord and understanding. As Ezra Pound wrote,
Cummings's Soviet Union is laid "out there pellucidly on the page in all its Slavic unfinishedness, in all of its
Dostoievskian slobberyness....Does any man wish to know about Russia? 'EIMI'!"

A stylistic tour de force, EIMI is a mélange of styles and tones, the prose containing many abbreviations,
grammatical and syntactical shifts, typographical devices, compounds, and word coinages. This is
Cummings's invigorating and unique voice at its finest, and EIMI is without question one of his most
substantial accomplishments.
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From reader reviews:

Tina Brookins:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be update about what going on or facts even knowledge
to make these keep up with the era which can be always change and make progress. Some of you maybe can
update themselves by examining books. It is a good choice for you but the problems coming to an individual
is you don't know which one you should start with. This EIMI: A Journey Through Soviet Russia is our
recommendation so you keep up with the world. Why, because this book serves what you want and want in
this era.

Margaret Gray:

This EIMI: A Journey Through Soviet Russia tend to be reliable for you who want to become a successful
person, why. The key reason why of this EIMI: A Journey Through Soviet Russia can be one of many great
books you must have is actually giving you more than just simple looking at food but feed an individual with
information that probably will shock your before knowledge. This book will be handy, you can bring it
everywhere you go and whenever your conditions in e-book and printed people. Beside that this EIMI: A
Journey Through Soviet Russia giving you an enormous of experience including rich vocabulary, giving you
test of critical thinking that could it useful in your day pastime. So , let's have it and luxuriate in reading.

Robert Eslinger:

This book untitled EIMI: A Journey Through Soviet Russia to be one of several books that best seller in this
year, this is because when you read this e-book you can get a lot of benefit on it. You will easily to buy that
book in the book store or you can order it via online. The publisher in this book sells the e-book too. It makes
you quickly to read this book, since you can read this book in your Smart phone. So there is no reason for
your requirements to past this e-book from your list.

Mary Gonzalez:

You can get this EIMI: A Journey Through Soviet Russia by look at the bookstore or Mall. Merely viewing
or reviewing it might to be your solve trouble if you get difficulties to your knowledge. Kinds of this reserve
are various. Not only by simply written or printed but can you enjoy this book by simply e-book. In the
modern era such as now, you just looking because of your mobile phone and searching what your problem.
Right now, choose your current ways to get more information about your book. It is most important to
arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still up-date. Let's try to choose correct ways for you.
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