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From market crisis to market boom, from welfare to wealth care, from homelessness to helplessness, and an
all-out assault on the global environment-these are just some of the indecencies of contemporary economic
life that Profit Pathology takes on. Here, Michael Parenti investigates how class power is a central force in
our political life and, yet, is subjected to little critical discernment. He notes how big-moneyed interests shift
the rules of the game in their favor while unveiling the long march by reactionaries through the nation's
institutions to undo all the gains of social democracy, from the New Deal to the present. Parenti also traces
the exploitative economic forces that have operated through much of American history, including the mass
displacement and extermination of Native Americans and the enslavement of Africans. Parenti is a master at
demonstrating the impact of monomaniacal profit accumulation on social services-especially health care-and
human values. Here he takes us one step further, showing how unrestrained capitalism ultimately endangers
itself, becoming a "self-devouring beast" that threatens us all. Finally, he calls for a solution based on
democratic diversity and public ownership-"because it works."
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From reader reviews:

Ronda Caesar:

Throughout other case, little individuals like to read book Profit Pathology and Other Indecencies. You can
choose the best book if you like reading a book. Provided that we know about how is important some sort of
book Profit Pathology and Other Indecencies. You can add understanding and of course you can around the
world with a book. Absolutely right, simply because from book you can know everything! From your
country until foreign or abroad you may be known. About simple thing until wonderful thing you may know
that. In this era, we are able to open a book as well as searching by internet system. It is called e-book. You
should use it when you feel weary to go to the library. Let's go through.

Emile Guzman:

The book Profit Pathology and Other Indecencies make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You need to use
to make your capable considerably more increase. Book can to get your best friend when you getting strain
or having big problem along with your subject. If you can make reading through a book Profit Pathology and
Other Indecencies to be your habit, you can get far more advantages, like add your current capable, increase
your knowledge about a few or all subjects. You are able to know everything if you like open and read a
reserve Profit Pathology and Other Indecencies. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science reserve or
encyclopedia or other folks. So , how do you think about this book?

Dennis Rodriguez:

What do you about book? It is not important along with you? Or just adding material if you want something
to explain what you problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy person? If you don't have spare
time to do others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored faster. And you have free time? What did
you do? All people has many questions above. They have to answer that question because just their can do
that. It said that about guide. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is appropriate. Because start from on
pre-school until university need this particular Profit Pathology and Other Indecencies to read.

Verna Tubbs:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our information for everything. By a book we can know
everything we would like. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every year
has been exactly added. This e-book Profit Pathology and Other Indecencies was filled concerning science.
Spend your free time to add your knowledge about your scientific research competence. Some people has
various feel when they reading a book. If you know how big benefit from a book, you can experience enjoy
to read a e-book. In the modern era like at this point, many ways to get book that you wanted.
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