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About seventy years after the death of Jesus, John of Patmos sent visionary messages to Christians in seven
cities of western Asia Minor. These messages would eventually become part of the New Testament canon, as
The Book of Revelation. What was John's message? What was its literary form? Did he write to a persecuted
minority or to Christians enjoying the social and material benefits of the Roman Empire? In search of
answers to these penetrating questions, Thompson critically examines the language, literature, history, and
social setting of the Book of the Apocalypse. Following a discussion of the importance of the genre
apocalypse, he closely analyzes the form and structure of the Revelation, its narrative and metaphoric unity,
the world created through John's visions, and the social conditions of the empire in which John wrote. He
offers an unprecedented interpretation of the role of boundaries in Revelation, a reassessment of the reign of
the Emperor Domitian, and a view of tribulation that integrates the literary vision of Revelation with the
reality of the lives of ordinary people in a Roman province. Throughout his study, Thompson argues that the
language of Revelation joins the ordinary to the extra-ordinary, earth to heaven, and local conditions to
supra-human processes.
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From reader reviews:

Juanita Stoneman:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in most way. By being competitive today, people
have do something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice
by simply surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated this for a while is
reading. Yes, by reading a reserve your ability to survive increase then having chance to stand than other is
high. For you who want to start reading any book, we give you this specific The Book of Revelation:
Apocalypse and Empire book as nice and daily reading book. Why, because this book is more than just a
book.

Jerry Melgar:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind skill
or thinking skill even analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book when compared
with can satisfy your short space of time to read it because all this time you only find reserve that need more
time to be learn. The Book of Revelation: Apocalypse and Empire can be your answer as it can be read by an
individual who have those short extra time problems.

Bradford Bryant:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make anyone
to understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information simpler to share.
You can find a lot of referrals to get information example: internet, paper, book, and soon. You can view that
now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. The actual book that recommended to you personally
is The Book of Revelation: Apocalypse and Empire this reserve consist a lot of the information with the
condition of this world now. This specific book was represented how do the world has grown up. The
language styles that writer use to explain it is easy to understand. The actual writer made some research
when he makes this book. That is why this book appropriate all of you.

Sean Rusin:

Beside this kind of The Book of Revelation: Apocalypse and Empire in your phone, it might give you a way
to get closer to the new knowledge or facts. The information and the knowledge you may got here is fresh
from the oven so don't possibly be worry if you feel like an aged people live in narrow small town. It is good
thing to have The Book of Revelation: Apocalypse and Empire because this book offers for you readable
information. Do you sometimes have book but you don't get what it's about. Oh come on, that won't happen
if you have this inside your hand. The Enjoyable set up here cannot be questionable, similar to treasuring
beautiful island. So do you still want to miss that? Find this book and read it from now!
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