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What to eat, what not to eat, and how to think about health: a manifesto for our times

"Eat food. Not too much. Mostly plants." These simple words go to the heart of Michael Pollan's In Defense
of Food, the well-considered answers he provides to the questions posed in the bestselling The Omnivore's
Dilemma.

Humans used to know how to eat well, Pollan argues. But the balanced dietary lessons that were once passed
down through generations have been confused, complicated, and distorted by food industry marketers,
nutritional scientists, and journalists-all of whom have much to gain from our dietary confusion. As a result,
we face today a complex culinary landscape dense with bad advice and foods that are not "real." These
"edible foodlike substances" are often packaged with labels bearing health claims that are typically false or
misleading. Indeed, real food is fast disappearing from the marketplace, to be replaced by "nutrients," and
plain old eating by an obsession with nutrition that is, paradoxically, ruining our health, not to mention our
meals. Michael Pollan's sensible and decidedly counterintuitive advice is: "Don't eat anything that your
great-great grandmother would not recognize as food."

Writing In Defense of Food, and affirming the joy of eating, Pollan suggests that if we would pay more for
better, well-grown food, but buy less of it, we'll benefit ourselves, our communities, and the environment at
large. Taking a clear-eyed look at what science does and does not know about the links between diet and
health, he proposes a new way to think about the question of what to eat that is informed by ecology and
tradition rather than by the prevailing nutrient-by-nutrient approach.

In Defense of Food reminds us that, despite the daunting dietary landscape Americans confront in the
modern supermarket, the solutions to the current omnivore's dilemma can be found all around us.

In looking toward traditional diets the world over, as well as the foods our families-and regions-historically
enjoyed, we can recover a more balanced, reasonable, and pleasurable approach to food. Michael Pollan's
bracing and eloquent manifesto shows us how we might start making thoughtful food choices that will enrich
our lives and enlarge our sense of what it means to be healthy.
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From reader reviews:

Harold Graham:

The reason why? Because this In Defense of Food: An Eater's Manifesto is an unordinary book that the
inside of the book waiting for you to snap it but latter it will distress you with the secret the idea inside.
Reading this book adjacent to it was fantastic author who also write the book in such amazing way makes the
content inside easier to understand, entertaining technique but still convey the meaning entirely. So , it is
good for you because of not hesitating having this any more or you going to regret it. This unique book will
give you a lot of rewards than the other book have such as help improving your ability and your critical
thinking means. So , still want to delay having that book? If I had been you I will go to the book store
hurriedly.

Stanley Torres:

Reading a book being new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to learn a book. When you read a
book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge, simply
because book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of book
that you have read. If you would like get information about your review, you can read education books, but if
you act like you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, and
soon. The In Defense of Food: An Eater's Manifesto provide you with a new experience in examining a
book.

Lawrence Woods:

Beside that In Defense of Food: An Eater's Manifesto in your phone, it could possibly give you a way to get
more close to the new knowledge or data. The information and the knowledge you are going to got here is
fresh from oven so don't possibly be worry if you feel like an outdated people live in narrow small town. It is
good thing to have In Defense of Food: An Eater's Manifesto because this book offers to you readable
information. Do you occasionally have book but you seldom get what it's about. Oh come on, that will not
happen if you have this in the hand. The Enjoyable set up here cannot be questionable, such as treasuring
beautiful island. Techniques you still want to miss this? Find this book in addition to read it from today!

Richard Chambers:

A lot of book has printed but it differs from the others. You can get it by web on social media. You can
choose the most beneficial book for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is known
as of book In Defense of Food: An Eater's Manifesto. You can contribute your knowledge by it. Without
leaving the printed book, it can add your knowledge and make anyone happier to read. It is most important
that, you must aware about guide. It can bring you from one destination to other place.
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