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From Book 1: Save by purchasing the box set (Books 1-3) on the author's profile page!

The hunt is on.

A pollute-addicted therapist named Meme battles his way through his mind and LA at the seat of his pants
alongside a beautiful android escort with a surprising secret. With the Federal Corporate Government
hunting him, will he make it to safety in time?

Life is a Beautiful Thing offers a shocking glimpse into a dark future fueled by corporate deceit and designer
intoxicants. Part dystopian science fiction, part hallucinatory thrill ride, this ground-breaking cyberpunk
series will keep you on the edge of your seat as the techno-craziness unfolds.

If Philip K. Dick, William Gibson, Kurt Vonnegut or Hunter S. Thompson are your thing, you'll love these
mind-bending books. Get started on Life is a Beautiful Thing today!

Reviews for Book One:

'An original and imaginative Cyberpunk page turner.' -UK reader

'Warning: addictive series.' -US reader

'Do Electric Sheep Dream Of Fear And Loathing In the Monkey House? This guy can write.' -US reader

'If Palahniuk wrote Trainspotting as a dystopian futuristic sci-fi, it would be this book.' Top 500 reviewer

'Love it or hate it -- this is stunning!' UK reader

'Strangely thrilling; imaginative and depressingly fresh, Cooper introduces a freakishly diverse cast of
characters in a futuristic setting that is, sadly, a feasible reality in which to devolve.' - Top 100 reviewer

'Mesmerizing, dark dystopian thriller.' -Top 500 reviewer

'Harmon Cooper: cyber-brilliant.' -US reader

'Sarcasm, dark humor and all the right stuff.' - US reader

'Definitely cyberpunk (William Gibson meets Phillip K. Dick) with a side order of Clockwork Orange sums
it up.' -- Goodreads reviewer

'Entertaining? Yes. Fascinating? Yes. Impossible to put down? YES!' - US reader

For fans of: Kurt Vonnegut, David Mitchell, Run the Jewels, Hunter S. Thompson, Kendrick Lamar,



Deadpool, William Gibson, The Field, William S. Burroughs, Philip K. Dick, drum and bass, Pulp Fiction,
Daft Punk, Jackson Pollock, Danny Brown, Burial, RATM, neologisms, Dali's mustache, Death Grips, The
Prodigy, Burning Man and Banksy.
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From reader reviews:

Eunice Buckley:

The book Life Is A Beautiful Thing (4 Book Series) gives you the sense of being enjoy for your spare time.
You need to use to make your capable far more increase. Book can being your best friend when you getting
strain or having big problem with your subject. If you can make examining a book Life Is A Beautiful Thing
(4 Book Series) to become your habit, you can get much more advantages, like add your own capable,
increase your knowledge about many or all subjects. You can know everything if you like available and read
a reserve Life Is A Beautiful Thing (4 Book Series). Kinds of book are several. It means that, science reserve
or encyclopedia or other people. So , how do you think about this book?

Ann Lang:

Now a day people who Living in the era just where everything reachable by match the internet and the
resources inside it can be true or not demand people to be aware of each information they get. How many
people to be smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Reading a
book can help folks out of this uncertainty Information mainly this Life Is A Beautiful Thing (4 Book Series)
book since this book offers you rich details and knowledge. Of course the knowledge in this book hundred
per cent guarantees there is no doubt in it you may already know.

Kerstin Torres:

Would you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt when you are in the book store? Try to
pick one book that you never know the inside because don't determine book by its handle may doesn't work
at this point is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not because fantastic as in the
outside search likes. Maybe you answer is usually Life Is A Beautiful Thing (4 Book Series) why because
the wonderful cover that make you consider concerning the content will not disappoint anyone. The inside or
content is usually fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly make
suggestions to pick up this book.

Charles Sizemore:

With this era which is the greater person or who has ability to do something more are more important than
other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What you should do is just
spending your time not very much but quite enough to possess a look at some books. One of many books in
the top list in your reading list is definitely Life Is A Beautiful Thing (4 Book Series). This book which can
be qualified as The Hungry Hillsides can get you closer in getting precious person. By looking right up and
review this guide you can get many advantages.
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