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"It only took one kiss... " Working two jobs to achieve her dream of moving to New York, Vegas showgirl
Sunny Johnson needs to save every penny. So when CEO Cole Benton makes a bottom-line decision to close
the revue show she dances in, she has no choice but to confront him for her sake and for the futures of all her
friends on the chorus line. Cole expects to inherit the reins to his family's chain of luxurious hotels and
casinos. That is until his grandmother drops a bomb--get married, or say farewell to his inheritance! And the
worst part? His grandmother has already decided on the lucky bride--Sunny. So before his true motives can
be revealed, one spontaneous kiss and sizzling-hot chemistry take over as Sunny and Cole fall into each
other's arms. But is it now too late to tell Sunny the truth? Could Cole's high-stakes gamble cost him
everything, including the woman he is beginning to adore?
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From reader reviews:

Angel Echols:

Book is usually written, printed, or descriptive for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a
publication. Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important factor to bring us around the world.
Close to that you can your reading talent was fluently. A book [(Vegas, Baby : Kimani Hotties: Promise Me
Forever)] [By (author) Theodora Taylor] published on (November, 2014) will make you to always be
smarter. You can feel more confidence if you can know about every little thing. But some of you think that
will open or reading a book make you bored. It is not necessarily make you fun. Why they may be thought
like that? Have you in search of best book or suitable book with you?

Ida Johnson:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children right up until adult are different content. To be sure
that book is very important for people. The book [(Vegas, Baby : Kimani Hotties: Promise Me Forever)] [By
(author) Theodora Taylor] published on (November, 2014) has been making you to know about other know-
how and of course you can take more information. It is extremely advantages for you. The publication
[(Vegas, Baby : Kimani Hotties: Promise Me Forever)] [By (author) Theodora Taylor] published on
(November, 2014) is not only giving you far more new information but also to become your friend when you
truly feel bored. You can spend your personal spend time to read your publication. Try to make relationship
while using book [(Vegas, Baby : Kimani Hotties: Promise Me Forever)] [By (author) Theodora Taylor]
published on (November, 2014). You never sense lose out for everything if you read some books.

Shirley Nichols:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people love it. First reading a reserve will give you a lot of new
facts. When you read a reserve you will get new information simply because book is one of various ways to
share the information or perhaps their idea. Second, reading through a book will make a person more
imaginative. When you reading through a book especially fictional works book the author will bring that you
imagine the story how the character types do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to
other folks. When you read this [(Vegas, Baby : Kimani Hotties: Promise Me Forever)] [By (author)
Theodora Taylor] published on (November, 2014), you may tells your family, friends in addition to soon
about yours guide. Your knowledge can inspire others, make them reading a e-book.

Jennifer Valdovinos:

A lot of guide has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by world wide web on social
media. You can choose the best book for you, science, comic, novel, or whatever simply by searching from
it. It is identified as of book [(Vegas, Baby : Kimani Hotties: Promise Me Forever)] [By (author) Theodora
Taylor] published on (November, 2014). You can add your knowledge by it. Without making the printed



book, it could possibly add your knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most critical that, you must
aware about guide. It can bring you from one destination for a other place.
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