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The employment of the first tanks by the British Army on the Western Front in September 1916, although
symbolic rather than decisive in its effects, ushered in a new form of warfare - tank warfare.

While much has been written on the history of the tank, this volume brings together a collection of essays
which uncover new aspects of the history of these early machines. Leading military historians from Britain,
France and Germany offer insights into the emergence of the tank before the First World War, during the
conflict, as well as what happened to them after the guns fell silent on the Western Front.

Based on painstaking research in archives across Europe, each of the chapters sheds new light on different
aspects of the history of First World tanks. Two chapters consider why the Germans failed to recognize the
possibilities of the tank and why they were so slow to develop their own machines after the first British tank
attack in 1916. Two other chapters chart the history of French tanks on the Western Front and after the end
of the war. Tank communication, the employment of British tanks on the Western Front, as well as the
activities of British Tank Corps intelligence, are also explained. The use of British tanks in Palestine and in
the Russian Civil War is examined in detail for the first time.

The volume also reflects on the impact of the Battle of Cambrai, both in terms of its psychological impact in
Britain and the power it exerted over military debates until the end of the Second World War. The aim of the
book is to reconsider the history of First World War tanks by widening the historical perspective beyond
Britain, to include France and Germany, and by reflecting on the pre-1914 and post-1918 history of the these
new weapons of war.
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From reader reviews:

Catherine Poppe:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always try to and must have the spare time or they will get great
deal of stress from both way of life and work. So , once we ask do people have free time, we will say
absolutely yes. People is human not only a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity do you possess
when the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer will certainly unlimited right. Then ever
try this one, reading publications. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, the actual book you
have read is Genesis, Employment, Aftermath: First World War Tanks and the New Warfare, 1900-1945
(Modern Military History).

Theresa Adams:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside together with friends, fun activity along with family
or just watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by reading a book.
Ugh, think reading a book will surely hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It ok you can
have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Cell phone. Like Genesis, Employment, Aftermath:
First World War Tanks and the New Warfare, 1900-1945 (Modern Military History) which is obtaining the
e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's view.

Brian Faber:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher requested them to go to the library or to make
summary for some publication, they are complained. Just very little students that has reading's heart and soul
or real their pastime. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to the library. They go to there but
nothing reading critically. Any students feel that examining is not important, boring and can't see colorful
pics on there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very important for yourself. As we know that on this
time, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, many ways to reach Chinese's country. So ,
this Genesis, Employment, Aftermath: First World War Tanks and the New Warfare, 1900-1945 (Modern
Military History) can make you experience more interested to read.

Jeffrey Baptiste:

Many people said that they feel bored stiff when they reading a reserve. They are directly felt that when they
get a half areas of the book. You can choose the actual book Genesis, Employment, Aftermath: First World
War Tanks and the New Warfare, 1900-1945 (Modern Military History) to make your personal reading is
interesting. Your personal skill of reading ability is developing when you such as reading. Try to choose
basic book to make you enjoy to see it and mingle the feeling about book and studying especially. It is to be
1st opinion for you to like to open up a book and learn it. Beside that the book Genesis, Employment,
Aftermath: First World War Tanks and the New Warfare, 1900-1945 (Modern Military History) can to be
your brand-new friend when you're really feel alone and confuse with the information must you're doing of



that time.
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