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"Who or what the other is, I never know. But the other who is forever unknowable is the one who differs
from me sexually. This feeling of surprise, astonishment, and wonder in the face of the unknowable ought to
be returned to its locus: that of sexual difference." Thus Luce Irigaray undertakes a searching inquiry into
what may be the philosophical problem of our age.

Irigaray approaches the question of sexual difference by looking at the ways in which thought and
language?whether in philosophy, science, or psychoanalysis?are gendered. She juxtaposes evocative
readings of classic texts, including Plato's Symposium, Aristotle's Physics, Descartes's "On Wonder" in The
Passions of the Soul, Spinoza's Ethics, Merleau-Ponty's The Visible and the Invisible, and Levinas's Totality
and Infinity, with meditations on experiences of love: between fetus and mother, between heterosexual
lovers, between women, and between women and their own bodies.

Exploding traditional dualities such as inside/outside, form/content, subject/object, and self/other, Irigaray
shows how an understanding of such experiences points to gender blindness in both classic and
contemporary theory. Asserting that women have never known a love of self out of which a non-dominated
love of the other is possible, Irigaray argues that only when women insist on the integrity of their own spaces
of embodiment can love become the basis of a revolution in ethics.

Published in French in 1984, An Ethics of Sexual Difference is now available in English in a superb
translation by Carolyn Burke and Gillian C. Gill. Readers interested in feminist theory, literary theory, and
philosophy?indeed anyone deeply concerned with gender relations?will be challenged by the brilliance and
boldness of Irigaray's analyses.
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From reader reviews:

Walter Gagne:

Inside other case, little individuals like to read book An Ethics of Sexual Difference. You can choose the best
book if you love reading a book. So long as we know about how is important a book An Ethics of Sexual
Difference. You can add expertise and of course you can around the world by the book. Absolutely right,
since from book you can learn everything! From your country right up until foreign or abroad you can be
known. About simple matter until wonderful thing you can know that. In this era, we can easily open a book
as well as searching by internet unit. It is called e-book. You may use it when you feel uninterested to go to
the library. Let's examine.

Sandra Conaway:

The book An Ethics of Sexual Difference make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You can utilize to make
your capable much more increase. Book can to become your best friend when you getting tension or having
big problem together with your subject. If you can make studying a book An Ethics of Sexual Difference for
being your habit, you can get more advantages, like add your own personal capable, increase your
knowledge about several or all subjects. It is possible to know everything if you like open and read a e-book
An Ethics of Sexual Difference. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science reserve or encyclopedia or
other people. So , how do you think about this e-book?

Donna Cauley:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind skill or
thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book as compared to can
satisfy your short time to read it because all of this time you only find e-book that need more time to be
learn. An Ethics of Sexual Difference can be your answer as it can be read by anyone who have those short
spare time problems.

Tammie Torres:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside with friends, fun activity together with family or just
watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by reading through a book.
Ugh, do you think reading a book will surely hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It
alright you can have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Cell phone. Like An Ethics of Sexual
Difference which is having the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's view.
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